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THANK YOU

Dear Prayer Partner,  

Have you ever paused to consider that when you pray for others,
you're following in the very footsteps of Jesus? What a humbling and
deeply moving truth. 

In Luke 22:32, Jesus prayed that Simon's faith would not fail - and in
John 17, we see His deep, heartfelt intercession for all believers. Even
now, He continues to intercede for us (Romans 8:34).

We're truly grateful for your prayers and the vital part you play in the
work of the Mission.

With sincere appreciation,

Kira and Oleksander, Ukraine

LET’S START PRAYING >>>
Mark
MWB SA Country Director
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Please join us in praying for
the families who will be
starting their self-sufficiency
projects this month. Pray the
implementation of these
projects would be successful
and help the families thrive.

Please pray for a single
father we support in Sarny,
Ukraine. Pray for strength
and wisdom as he brings up
his children alone and copes
with the daily challenges. 

We are so thankful for all of
the international support we
receive, for all of the donors
and sponsors who enable us
to provide ongoing support
families and children.  
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Self-sufficiency support, 
Ukraine
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Please pray for our
Vocational Education Centre
in Sarny, that all of our
students would successfully
pass their exams and would
gain employment in their
chosen professions.

Please pray for our summer
camps. Pray for all of the
children attending and for
the teams who will be
serving at the camps. Due to
the war it has been a
challenge to find volunteers.

MAY

UKRAINE
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Please join us in praying for
our coordinators. That the
Lord would guide them and
give them strength and
wisdom as they serve and
support our communities. 

Today (11th) is our country’s
parliamentary general
election. Please pray for
peace, fairness and
integrity.

Please pray for the children
who have started attending
church through our
Christian Outreach projects.
Pray for our church
partners as they invest into
the lives of these children.  

MWB Coordinator,
Albania
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With our summer camps
starting next month, please
pray that God would guide
our preparations and that
the children who will be
attending would encounter
Jesus in a life-changing way.

Please join us in praying for
the elderly individuals that
we support, that God would
meet their needs,
strengthen them and help
them to face the challenges
of life with hope.    

“I will instruct you and
teach you in the way

you should go”

Psalm 32:8

MAY

ALBANIA
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We’re excited to host sponsor
tours and fundraising visits
this month. Please pray that
these visits will be meaningful
and fruitful as we share the
impact of our work in
Romania.

We’re grateful to share that
Laurentiu, a 13-year-old boy
we support from Sibiu, is
recovering well after
successful heart surgery.
Please keep him in prayer
for his follow-up checkups.

Please pray for our summer
camps that are starting in
June. We will be hosting 14
camps across 6 locations.
Pray for our teams as they
carry out final preparations
for an amazing week of fun.

Codruta and Maria (volunteer) at
Summer Camp, Romania
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We are celebrating that more
adults and children are
starting to attend church. We
are grateful for all of our
church partners, volunteers
and pastors who faithfully
support our work.

Please pray for the family of
a 16-year-old boy we
supported who passed away
from diabetes complications.
They’re grieving deeply,
having also lost the father
two years ago.

Supporting teenagers,
Romania
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27-28

Please join us in praying for
the younger generation. That
God would protect them
from drugs, alcohol and
violence, and that they would
discover His love for them
through our work.

ROMANIA

MAY
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Philippians 4:4
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Anita at Summer Camp,
Albania
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As our scholarship students
finish the school in June,
please join us in praying for
God’s direction as they
make decisions about their
future, and for endurance
over those still in education.

Please pray for the health
of those we support. In
recent months, several
have been diagnosed with
serious illnesses. Join us in
praying for their healing
and strength.

Scholarship student,
Bulgaria
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01-02

Please pray for good
weather this summer, for all
the families who are growing
crops for food or to sell as a
source of income. 
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We are so thankful to God
that we are able to support
children and adults with
disabilities. Please pray for
their health and wellbeing
and that we’d see more
salvations at our clubs.

Please join us in praying for
more local volunteers to
help support our family
communities. We pray that
more individuals would
answer the call to serve
those living in poverty.

JUNE

BULGARIA

Beloved, I pray that all may
go well with you and that you

may be in good health, as it
goes well with your soul.

3 John 1:2
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Please join us in praying for
our students who currently
have exams. Pray for those
who are graduating this
year, that they will make
wise decisions as they follow
their dreams.

Please pray for the
agricultural support we
provide to families as they
work towards self-
sufficiency. We pray that it
would be a fruitful year. 

Please pray for our summer
camps. That the children
attending would have a great
time, away from their daily
struggles, and experience
God's love through our staff
and volunteers.
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Summer Camp,
Moldova
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MOLDOVA
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SELF-SUFFICIENCY:
MOLDOVA 

Our self-sufficiency
support in Moldova is
designed to help families
and individuals start or
develop small businesses
or increase their earning
capacity in other ways.

For some, this means
providing agricultural
support, in the form of
seeds, greenhouses or
machinery. In other
cases, we equip people to
use their skills to set up
businesses in areas such
as hairdressing, baking,
or tailoring. 

The purpose of this
investment is to help
families and individuals
increase their incomes
and become more
financially stable. 

Please pray for the 57
families who will be starting
self-sufficiency projects this
year. 
Read more here >>>

Join us in praying for our
upcoming volunteer training
seminars. Please pray that
the training would be
effective as they continue to
serve the children we
support.
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Please pray the families who
receive self-sufficiency
support, that these financial
and material investments
would act as a springboard
towards breaking the cycle
of poverty.

Please pray over the political
situation in our country, that
we would see peace and
stability.

Self-sufficiency support,
Bosnia-Herzegovina
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21-22

As our summer camps begin
this month, we invite you to
pray with us—for the
children attending, that
these camps would be fun,
restorative, and truly life-
changing.

JUNE

BOSNIA-HERZEGOVINA 
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Please pray for God's
protection over the well-
being of the families we work
with. Many are struggling
with serious health
problems, and we pray that
they will receive healing.

Please join us in praying for
our After School projects
and the new children who
have joined us this year. 

After school, Bosnia-Herzegovina 

JUNE

BOSNIA-HERZEGOVINA 



STAY IN TOUCH

OUR VISION

Lives transformed across
generations with hope for the
future.

Olena and her daughter,
Ukraine

T:

A:

E:

+27 79 826 3630

Southdowns Ridge Office Park,

John Vorster Drive, Centurion,

Pretoria, 0062

mwbsa@mwbi.org 

CONTACT US

WWW.MWB-SA.ORG

https://www.missionwithoutborders.org.za/

